
5”x3”x1.5” Sturdy enough to 
ship, these small boxes fit 
jewelry, pens, art, crystals and 
more.

6”x4”x3” The perfect box for 
event favors, wedding gifts, 
small handmade items, and 
large jewelry items.

7”x5”x3” This box boasts a 
sturdy weight, yet modest 
enough sizing for 
subscriptions, event swag, 
gifts, and retail.

8”x6”x3” This box works for 
gifts, subscription boxes, retail 
boxes, and box lunches. It’s so 
versatile, you can stock up 
and use it for multiple 
products.

9”x7”x2.25” Perfect for the 
top-open reveal of a display 
box but the extra depth of a 
shipping box. Stationary, 
framed art, and clothing all sit 
center stage.

9”x6”x4” One of our most 
popular! You can fit 8.5 x 5.5 
folded documents, paperback 
books, small framed art, and 
kids clothing in this box.

9.5”x7.75”x4” That desirable 
top-open reveal, plenty of 
branding space, and a white 
interior so you can help your 
customers frame their 
unboxing pics with a basic 
white or a splash of color.

11.25”x9”x3” This box is 
perfect for the top-open 
reveal of a display box but 
feature a little extra width. 
Books, framed art, and 
clothing all sit center stage 
with this unboxing.

12”x10”x4” This box is 
perfect for the top-open 
reveal of a display box but 
feature a little extra height. 
This is our largest display style 
offered.
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More sizes/styles available upon request!


